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For well over a century, the modern skyscraper has provided an ingenious solution to high-density living and
working - accommodating the greatest number of people in a building with a minimal footprint. In the
contemporary context of drastic urban growth, its role can only gain in importance. The question is how to
avoid past mistakes and how to conceive the tower as a positive component of an existing or newly created
urban fabric. In a thoroughly analytical and comparative way The Urban Towers Handbook provides
answers to these questions and serves as a reference book and design tool for architects, planners and
developers alike. Its comprehensive graphic documentation includes not only aerials and to-scale plans and
sections, but also purpose-made photography, drawings and diagrams.

The core of the book is made up of over fifty case studies which have been classified according to three
major typological groups and their respective sub-groups: solitaires, clusters and vertical cities. Twenty-one
of these examples feature detailed documentation, including classics such as the Rockefeller Center in
Manhattan and Torre Velasca in Milan, as well as contemporary milestones such as Roppongi Hills in Tokyo
and the making of Sheikh Zayed Road in Dubai. Among others, several districts in Hong Kong, Shanghai
and São Paulo have been analysed as existing examples of vertical cities. The case studies section of the
book is consolidated by a second section that outlines high-rise regulations in seven cities around the world,
and highlights how planning authorities use tall buildings for the realisation of their urban goals and visions.
The third and final section of the book addresses the uneasy relationship between high-rise structures and
sustainability, placing the emphasis on the urban implications.
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From reader reviews:

Randall Yang:

The ability that you get from The Urban Towers Handbook could be the more deep you excavating the
information that hide inside the words the more you get enthusiastic about reading it. It does not mean that
this book is hard to recognise but The Urban Towers Handbook giving you enjoyment feeling of reading.
The article author conveys their point in a number of way that can be understood by simply anyone who read
this because the author of this reserve is well-known enough. This particular book also makes your personal
vocabulary increase well. It is therefore easy to understand then can go together with you, both in printed or
e-book style are available. We recommend you for having this kind of The Urban Towers Handbook
instantly.

Benjamin Ward:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the subject The Urban
Towers Handbook suitable to you? Often the book was written by well known writer in this era. The
particular book untitled The Urban Towers Handbookis a single of several books which everyone read now.
That book was inspired many people in the world. When you read this book you will enter the new
dimension that you ever know just before. The author explained their plan in the simple way, consequently
all of people can easily to recognise the core of this reserve. This book will give you a lots of information
about this world now. So you can see the represented of the world in this particular book.

Christopher Helland:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, limited story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not seeking The Urban Towers Handbook that
give your fun preference will be satisfied by simply reading this book. Reading practice all over the world
can be said as the opportinity for people to know world far better then how they react in the direction of the
world. It can't be stated constantly that reading behavior only for the geeky person but for all of you who
wants to possibly be success person. So , for all you who want to start reading as your good habit, you could
pick The Urban Towers Handbook become your personal starter.

Moses Bean:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray an individual, why because this The Urban Towers Handbook book
written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book that may be understand by anyone
who have read the book. Written within good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and composing
skill only for eliminate your hunger then you still question The Urban Towers Handbook as good book not
only by the cover but also with the content. This is one reserve that can break don't ascertain book by its
cover, so do you still needing one more sixth sense to pick this particular!? Oh come on your reading sixth
sense already said so why you have to listening to a different sixth sense.
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