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Black barbers, reflected a freed slave who barbered in antebellum St. Louis, may have been the only men in
their community who enjoyed, at all times, the privilege of free speech. The reason lay in their
temporary?but absolute?power over a client. With a flick of the wrist, they could have slit the throats of the
white men they shaved. In Knights of the Razor, Douglas Walter Bristol, Jr., explores this extraordinary
relationship in the largely untold story of African American barbers, North and South, from the American
Revolution to the First World War.

In addition to establishing the modern-day barbershop, these barbers used their skilled trade to navigate the
many pitfalls that racism created for ambitious black men. Successful barbers assumed leadership roles in
their localities, helping to form a black middle class despite pervasive racial segregation. They advocated
economic independence from whites and founded insurance companies that became some of the largest
black-owned corporations.
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From reader reviews:

Charles Kinsella:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important work, like looking
for your favorite guide and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add your
knowledge by the publication entitled Knights of the Razor: Black Barbers in Slavery and Freedom. Try to
stumble through book Knights of the Razor: Black Barbers in Slavery and Freedom as your buddy. It means
that it can to get your friend when you really feel alone and beside associated with course make you smarter
than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for yourself. The book makes you much more confidence because you
can know anything by the book. So , we should make new experience in addition to knowledge with this
book.

Angela Thomas:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be up-date about what going on or details even
knowledge to make them keep up with the era which can be always change and move forward. Some of you
maybe will update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to
a person is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Knights of the Razor: Black Barbers in
Slavery and Freedom is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, since this book
serves what you want and want in this era.

Phillis Ries:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you can have it in
e-book approach, more simple and reachable. This particular Knights of the Razor: Black Barbers in Slavery
and Freedom can give you a lot of close friends because by you taking a look at this one book you have point
that they don't and make a person more like an interesting person. This book can be one of a step for you to
get success. This reserve offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more
than different make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? Let's have Knights of the Razor:
Black Barbers in Slavery and Freedom.

Virginia Higgins:

Book is one of source of expertise. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen require book to know the update information of year to help year. As we know
those ebooks have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, could also bring us to around the world.
From the book Knights of the Razor: Black Barbers in Slavery and Freedom we can take more advantage.
Don't one to be creative people? To become creative person must choose to read a book. Merely choose the
best book that acceptable with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life by this book Knights
of the Razor: Black Barbers in Slavery and Freedom. You can more appealing than now.
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