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In Gang of Five, bestselling author Nina J. Easton adds an important element to the history of American
politics in the last thirty years. This is the story of the other, less well known segment of the baby-boom
generation. These are young conservative activists who arrived on campus in the 1970s in rebellion against
everything "sixties" and went on to overturn the political dynamics of the country in the 1980s and 1990s.
They've been waging what Newt Gingrich called a "war without blood" for three decades. Gang of Five
portrays the intertwining careers of five major figures:

BILL KRISTOL, the Harvard-educated elitist and publisher of the Weekly Standard, is the liberal
establishment's worst nightmare -- a witty, erudite Rightist who was a leading force behind the demise of the
Clinton health care plan, the historic reform of welfare, and the decision of House Republicans to impeach
the president.

RALPH REED, the hardball politico who helped turn an organization called the College Republicans into a
kind of communist cell of the Right, in the 1990s tried to give the Religious Right a softer face as leader of
the Christian Coalition but was thwarted by his thirst for power and the narrow fundamentalism of his
activist followers.

CLINT BOLICK, a leading force in the spread of school choice programs and the anti-affirmative action
strategist who sank Lani Guinier's appointment, is the idealist who seeks to convince civil rights leaders that
his legal work on behalf of disadvantaged minorities is sincere and that liberal programs hurt the people they
are meant to help.

GROVER NORQUIST, the "market Leninist" who divides the world into "good" and "evil," is at the hub of
Hillary Clinton's "vast right-wing conspiracy" and is the architect of a no-new-taxes pledge signed by all
major Republican candidates in the 1990s.

DAVID MCINTOSH, the policy wonk who took the movement's war on Washington to Congress as leader
of the House Republican freshmen during the Gingrich Revolution, pushed his party toward confrontation
with the White House and is now running for governor in Indiana.

In contrast to earlier generations of conservatives, these leaders and their allies tasted success, first with
Ronald Reagan's twin victories in the 1980s and then, in the 1990s, with the Republican capture of Congress.
They play to win and have had a hand in every major insurrection from the Right over the past two decades -
- from abortion politics to government shutdowns to political muckracking. No politician can ignore their
agenda or escape the new hardball rules they've written for national politics.
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From reader reviews:

Dale Hollander:

The book Gang of Five: Leaders at the Center of the Conservative Crusade can give more knowledge and
information about everything you want. So why must we leave a very important thing like a book Gang of
Five: Leaders at the Center of the Conservative Crusade? Wide variety you have a different opinion about
guide. But one aim this book can give many data for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer
with the book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, it is possible to give for each other; it is possible
to share all of these. Book Gang of Five: Leaders at the Center of the Conservative Crusade has simple shape
however you know: it has great and big function for you. You can appearance the enormous world by
available and read a book. So it is very wonderful.

Gerald Patton:

The guide untitled Gang of Five: Leaders at the Center of the Conservative Crusade is the book that
recommended to you to study. You can see the quality of the reserve content that will be shown to an
individual. The language that author use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand.
The article writer was did a lot of exploration when write the book, therefore the information that they share
to your account is absolutely accurate. You also can get the e-book of Gang of Five: Leaders at the Center of
the Conservative Crusade from the publisher to make you far more enjoy free time.

Frances Pierce:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them friends and
family or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or
maybe playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity honestly, that is look different
you can read the book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent all day
every day to reading a guide. The book Gang of Five: Leaders at the Center of the Conservative Crusade it is
quite good to read. There are a lot of those who recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this
book. In case you did not have enough space to develop this book you can buy the actual e-book. You can
m0ore easily to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book offers high
quality.

Anne Young:

This Gang of Five: Leaders at the Center of the Conservative Crusade is great publication for you because
the content and that is full of information for you who all always deal with world and get to make decision
every minute. This specific book reveal it information accurately using great organize word or we can
declare no rambling sentences included. So if you are read the idea hurriedly you can have whole data in it.
Doesn't mean it only will give you straight forward sentences but challenging core information with lovely
delivering sentences. Having Gang of Five: Leaders at the Center of the Conservative Crusade in your hand



like obtaining the world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous 1. We can say that no reserve that offer
you world within ten or fifteen minute right but this e-book already do that. So , this is good reading book.
Hi Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt which?
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