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In The Language of Bribery Cases, Roger W. Shuy analyzes the role that language plays in bribery cases. He
describes twelve court cases for which he served as an expert witness or consultant and explains the issues at
stake in each of these cases, for both lawyers and linguists. The cases described include the bribery or
alleged bribery of United States senators, congressmen, judges, businessmen, and brothel owners. Shuy
describes the often-unused linguistic analytical tools that are available to both the prosecution and defense as
they argue these cases. He illustrates how grammatical referencing, speech acts, discourse structure, framing,
conveyed meaning, and intentionality can be useful, describing how these tools affected the outcomes of the
particular cases discussed in this book. The cases, fascinating in their own right, offer valuable insights not
only to linguists, but also to lawyers who argue bribery cases, many of whom may not be aware of the
linguistic tools available to them.
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From reader reviews:

James Sharpton:

What do you think of book? It is just for students as they are still students or the idea for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that question above. Every
person has several personality and hobby per other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they
don't need do that. You must know how great and also important the book The Language of Bribery Cases
(Oxford Studies in Language and Law). All type of book are you able to see on many methods. You can look
for the internet resources or other social media.

Shannon Bland:

What do you regarding book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you really need
something to explain what you problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy particular person? If
you don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have free
time? What did you do? All people has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that question due to
the fact just their can do that will. It said that about book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is
appropriate. Because start from on pre-school until university need this particular The Language of Bribery
Cases (Oxford Studies in Language and Law) to read.

Susan Munoz:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind skill or
thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book compared to can
satisfy your short period of time to read it because all this time you only find guide that need more time to be
learn. The Language of Bribery Cases (Oxford Studies in Language and Law) can be your answer since it
can be read by an individual who have those short time problems.

Irving Dorn:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside together with friends, fun activity using family or
just watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by examining a book.
Ugh, think reading a book will surely hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It alright you
can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like The Language of Bribery
Cases (Oxford Studies in Language and Law) which is having the e-book version. So , try out this book?
Let's see.
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