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Forty years ago, a majority of Americans were highly engaged in issues of war and peace. Whether to go to
war or keep out of conflicts was a vital question at the heart of the country’s vibrant, if fractious, democracy.
But American political consciousness has drifted. In the last decade, America has gone to war in Iraq and
Afghanistan, while pursuing a new kind of warfare in Yemen, Somalia, Libya, and Pakistan. National
security issues have increasingly faded from the political agenda, due in part to the growth of government
secrecy.

In lucid and chilling detail, journalist and lawyer Scott Horton shows how secrecy has changed the way
America functions. Executive decisions about war and peace are increasingly made by autonomous, self-
directing, and unaccountable national security elites. Secrecy is justified as part of a bargain under which the
state promises to keep the people safe from its enemies, but in fact allows excesses, mistakes, and crimes to
go unchecked. Bureaucracies use secrets to conceal their mistakes and advance their power in government,
invariable at the expense of the rights of the people. Never before have the American people had so little
information concerning the wars waged in their name, nor has Congress exercised so little oversight over the
war effort. American democracy is in deep trouble.

Lords of Secrecy explores the most important national security debates of our time, including the legal and
moral issues surrounding the turn to private security contractors, the sweeping surveillance methods of
intelligence agencies, and the use of robotic weapons such as drones. Horton looks at the legal edifice upon
which these decisions are based and discusses approaches to rolling back the flood of secrets that is
engulfing America today.Whistleblowers, but also Congress, the public, and the media, play a vital role in
this process.

As the ancient Greeks recognized, too much secrecy changes the nature of the state itself, transforming a
democracy into something else. Horton reminds us that dealing with the country’s national security concerns
is both a right and a responsibility of a free citizenry, something that has always sat at the heart of any
democracy that earns the name.
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From reader reviews:

James Fitzgibbons:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray a person, why because this Lords of Secrecy: The National Security
Elite and America's Stealth Warfare publication written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to
make book which can be understand by anyone who read the book. Written with good manner for you, still
dripping wet every ideas and creating skill only for eliminate your personal hunger then you still doubt Lords
of Secrecy: The National Security Elite and America's Stealth Warfare as good book not just by the cover but
also through the content. This is one reserve that can break don't determine book by its include, so do you
still needing yet another sixth sense to pick this particular!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already
told you so why you have to listening to yet another sixth sense.

Delores Villarreal:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside with friends, fun activity together with family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by reading a book. Ugh,
think reading a book really can hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It ok you can have the
e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Lords of Secrecy: The National Security
Elite and America's Stealth Warfare which is having the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's observe.

Donna Hubbard:

This Lords of Secrecy: The National Security Elite and America's Stealth Warfare is new way for you who
has interest to look for some information given it relief your hunger of information. Getting deeper you in it
getting knowledge more you know or perhaps you who still having tiny amount of digest in reading this
Lords of Secrecy: The National Security Elite and America's Stealth Warfare can be the light food to suit
your needs because the information inside this kind of book is easy to get by simply anyone. These books
develop itself in the form which is reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book contact form. People who
think that in reserve form make them feel tired even dizzy this guide is the answer. So there isn't any in
reading a reserve especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for an individual.
So , don't miss the item! Just read this e-book type for your better life and also knowledge.

Trent Gibson:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got scholars? We believe that that problem was
given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. Therefore you
know that little person like reading or as looking at become their hobby. You have to know that reading is
very important and book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to include you knowledge, except your
own teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update about something by book. A substantial number of
sorts of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is actually Lords of Secrecy: The National
Security Elite and America's Stealth Warfare.
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