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A "kindred spirit" of readers around the world

At sixteen, Anne is both exhilarated and slightly terrified to be teaching at the Avonlea schoolhouse. But
she's determined to win the heart of every student--especially troublemaker Anthony Pye. After all, she still
knows a thing or two about troublemaking herself...

With rambunctious six-year-old twins staying at Green Gables, a village "improvement" project that goes
disastrously wrong, and her college entrance exams to study for, Anne will more than have her hands full. At
least her best friend Diana and tormentor-turned-ally, the dashing Gilbert Blythe, will be there to help see her
through.

Inspiring the dreamer in all of us, Anne is hailed as a favorite by everyone from Mark Twain to Duchess
Kate.

This new edition lovingly restores the original, unabridged text and includes an all-new, exclusive
introduction with special memories from L.M. Montgomery's granddaughter.
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From reader reviews:

Ismael Roop:

The book Anne of Avonlea (Anne of Green Gables) can give more knowledge and information about
everything you want. So just why must we leave a very important thing like a book Anne of Avonlea (Anne
of Green Gables)? Wide variety you have a different opinion about reserve. But one aim in which book can
give many information for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge or
info that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you may share all of these. Book Anne of
Avonlea (Anne of Green Gables) has simple shape but you know: it has great and massive function for you.
You can seem the enormous world by wide open and read a book. So it is very wonderful.

Ronald Jackson:

This Anne of Avonlea (Anne of Green Gables) is great e-book for you because the content that is certainly
full of information for you who also always deal with world and get to make decision every minute. This
book reveal it information accurately using great coordinate word or we can claim no rambling sentences
within it. So if you are read that hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you
straight forward sentences but tough core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having Anne of
Avonlea (Anne of Green Gables) in your hand like obtaining the world in your arm, details in it is not
ridiculous one. We can say that no publication that offer you world with ten or fifteen small right but this
guide already do that. So , it is good reading book. Hey there Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt in
which?

Lavada Rowlett:

The book untitled Anne of Avonlea (Anne of Green Gables) contain a lot of information on the item. The
writer explains the woman idea with easy means. The language is very clear and understandable all the
people, so do not worry, you can easy to read this. The book was written by famous author. The author gives
you in the new era of literary works. You can read this book because you can please read on your smart
phone, or model, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book,
you can open their official web-site and order it. Have a nice study.

Harry Alvey:

This Anne of Avonlea (Anne of Green Gables) is fresh way for you who has attention to look for some
information mainly because it relief your hunger of knowledge. Getting deeper you on it getting knowledge
more you know or perhaps you who still having small amount of digest in reading this Anne of Avonlea
(Anne of Green Gables) can be the light food in your case because the information inside this specific book
is easy to get by anyone. These books create itself in the form which is reachable by anyone, yes I mean in
the e-book form. People who think that in e-book form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this reserve is the
answer. So there isn't any in reading a book especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should
be here for anyone. So , don't miss it! Just read this e-book style for your better life and knowledge.
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