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An entertaining tour of the science of humor and laughter

Humor, like pornography, is famously difficult to define. We know it when we see it, but is there any way to
figure out what we really find funny? In this fascinating investigation into the science of humor and laughter,
neuroscientist Scott Weems uncovers what’s happening in our heads when we giggle, guffaw, or double over
with laughter. Beginning with the premise that humor arises from inner conflict in the brain, Weems explores
such issues as why surprise is so important for humor, why computers are terrible at recognizing what’s
funny, and why cringe-worthy stereotypes make us laugh the hardest. From the role of insult jokes to the
benefit of laughing for our immune system responses, Ha! reveals why humor is so idiosyncratic, and why
how-to books alone will never help us become funnier people. Packed with the latest research, amusing
anecdotes (and even a few jokes), Ha! is a delightful tour of why humor is so important to our daily lives.
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From reader reviews:

Danny Nehring:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Sure, you can
choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a stroll,
shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or even read a book called Ha!: The Science of When We
Laugh and Why? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your time
together with your favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with its opinion or you have
some other opinion?

Mary Torres:

This Ha!: The Science of When We Laugh and Why tend to be reliable for you who want to be a successful
person, why. The main reason of this Ha!: The Science of When We Laugh and Why can be one of the great
books you must have is actually giving you more than just simple reading through food but feed you with
information that possibly will shock your previous knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring it almost
everywhere and whenever your conditions at e-book and printed types. Beside that this Ha!: The Science of
When We Laugh and Why forcing you to have an enormous of experience for instance rich vocabulary,
giving you demo of critical thinking that could it useful in your day activity. So , let's have it and luxuriate in
reading.

Loretta Faria:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book and so. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a book will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a e-book you will get new information due to the fact book is one of many ways
to share the information or even their idea. Second, reading a book will make you actually more imaginative.
When you reading through a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring someone to imagine the
story how the character types do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to others. When
you read this Ha!: The Science of When We Laugh and Why, you may tells your family, friends and also
soon about yours book. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a guide.

Emily Meredith:

You can get this Ha!: The Science of When We Laugh and Why by check out the bookstore or Mall. Just
simply viewing or reviewing it could to be your solve problem if you get difficulties for the knowledge.
Kinds of this guide are various. Not only simply by written or printed but in addition can you enjoy this book
simply by e-book. In the modern era including now, you just looking from your mobile phone and searching
what your problem. Right now, choose your ways to get more information about your book. It is most
important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose suitable
ways for you.
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