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In Detail

In recent years, we’ve enjoyed being able to do more and more online and in the cloud. Google Drive brings
the power and convenience of working online for you and your files. With Google Drive, you can create and
store your files safely in the cloud, share them if desired, and access them from anywhere using a web
browser, smartphone, or tablet computer.

"Google Drive Starter" is your companion to getting started with the world of cloud computing and working
with your files online. With clear visuals and step-by-step examples, this book shows you how to use Google
Drive from start to finish. From creating documents and files in Google Drive to sharing them with others
and accessing them anywhere using your web browser, phone, or tablet computer – you’ll be working in the
cloud.

This book starts with the very basics of cloud computing, providing clear examples for ways you can use
Google Drive to work with your files in the cloud, and the benefits of doing so. It will take you step-by-step
through all the aspects of using Google Drive to get you quickly working with your files online, accessing
them from anywhere using a web browser, smartphone, or tablet computer.

You’ll learn how to use Google Drive to create documents, spreadsheets, and presentations, and also how
you can upload folders and files from your hard drive into Google Drive using your web browser. Once your
files are in Google Drive, this book will show you all the things you can do with them: edit them online from
anywhere (including your iPhone, iPad, or Android phone or tablet), and even share them with others if
desired. This book will also show you how to use the Google Drive sync program to back up your files to the
cloud and keep them automatically in sync between your computer’s hard drive and Google Drive.

You will learn everything you need to know to create and store your files safely in the cloud with Google
Drive, share them with others if desired, and access them from anywhere using a web browser, smartphone,
or tablet computer.

Approach

Get to grips with a new technology, understand what it is and what it can do for you, and then get to work
with the most important features and tasks. This book is a Starter which teaches you how to use Google
Drive practically.

Who this book is for

This book is perfect for people of all skill levels who want to enjoy the benefits of using Google Drive to
safely store their files online and in the cloud. It’s also great for anyone looking to learn more about cloud
computing in general. Readers are expected to have an Internet connection and basic knowledge of using the
internet.
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From reader reviews:

Paul Howard:

As people who live in often the modest era should be update about what going on or facts even knowledge to
make these individuals keep up with the era which is always change and move ahead. Some of you maybe
will update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to you
is you don't know which you should start with. This Instant Google Drive Starter is our recommendation to
help you keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Roger Alford:

This Instant Google Drive Starter are generally reliable for you who want to be described as a successful
person, why. The explanation of this Instant Google Drive Starter can be among the great books you must
have is definitely giving you more than just simple looking at food but feed an individual with information
that probably will shock your preceding knowledge. This book is definitely handy, you can bring it almost
everywhere and whenever your conditions throughout the e-book and printed people. Beside that this Instant
Google Drive Starter forcing you to have an enormous of experience for example rich vocabulary, giving
you tryout of critical thinking that we all know it useful in your day task. So , let's have it and revel in
reading.

Benjamin Deloatch:

Instant Google Drive Starter can be one of your starter books that are good idea. All of us recommend that
straight away because this guide has good vocabulary which could increase your knowledge in language,
easy to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The copy writer giving
his/her effort to set every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing Instant Google Drive Starter but
doesn't forget the main stage, giving the reader the hottest and also based confirm resource information that
maybe you can be considered one of it. This great information can easily drawn you into completely new
stage of crucial contemplating.

Martha Royal:

You can find this Instant Google Drive Starter by check out the bookstore or Mall. Only viewing or
reviewing it could possibly to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties for the knowledge. Kinds of this
reserve are various. Not only simply by written or printed but in addition can you enjoy this book by means
of e-book. In the modern era similar to now, you just looking from your mobile phone and searching what
their problem. Right now, choose your ways to get more information about your publication. It is most
important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still up-date. Let's try to choose right ways
for you.
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