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A much-anticipated second edition to this classic practice-building text.

Building Your Ideal Private Practice, a best-seller in its genre, is now fully revised after its original
publication in 2000. Much has changed for therapists in private practice over the past fifteen years, including
the widespread encroachment by insurance and managed care into the marketplace, the density of new
therapists as over 600,000 therapists nation-wide try to stay viable, and the role of the Internet in marketing
services. The revision of Building Your Ideal Private Practice is a comprehensive guide, updated with six
new chapters and targeted for therapists at all stages of private practice development. It covers the essential
how-to questions for those starting out in practice and explains the common pitfalls to avoid.

For those already in practice, worried about profitability in an age of increasing competition, the author
offers informed strategies such as the best way to create websites and other online marketing to find clients,
and then goes further to explain how to retain the new breed of fickle clients who shop for therapists online,
but are hard to satisfy. Other new chapters support veteran therapists edging towards retirement, including
how to sell a therapy business for a profit or whether to stay working solo or expand into a more lucrative
group business model.

The revision comprises a complete, easy to use and fascinating business plan that shows therapists not just
what to do, but also who to be in order to succeed. It adds depth, up-to-date information and a wealth of
strategies to the original book, often referred to as the “bible” for therapists in private practice. Like the
original, the revision conveys the author’s experience, optimism and warmth as she presents case examples,
checklists and exercises to make the business advice come alive.

Whether you have insurance-based or a fee-for-service practice, this book will help you thrive.
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From reader reviews:

Karla Whisenant:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Guide is very important thing for
us to learn everything in the world. Each guide has different aim as well as goal; it means that book has
different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They are really
reading whatever they get because their hobby is actually reading a book. Consider the person who don't like
studying a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book whenever they found difficult problem or
perhaps exercise. Well, probably you will need this Building Your Ideal Private Practice: A Guide for
Therapists and Other Healing Professionals.

Charity Reulet:

This Building Your Ideal Private Practice: A Guide for Therapists and Other Healing Professionals is great
reserve for you because the content that is certainly full of information for you who all always deal with
world and have to make decision every minute. This kind of book reveal it info accurately using great
organize word or we can claim no rambling sentences inside it. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have
whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with straight forward sentences but tough core
information with wonderful delivering sentences. Having Building Your Ideal Private Practice: A Guide for
Therapists and Other Healing Professionals in your hand like getting the world in your arm, facts in it is not
ridiculous 1. We can say that no reserve that offer you world with ten or fifteen moment right but this guide
already do that. So , it is good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. hectic do you still doubt which?

Shane Bodine:

This Building Your Ideal Private Practice: A Guide for Therapists and Other Healing Professionals is fresh
way for you who has intense curiosity to look for some information given it relief your hunger of knowledge.
Getting deeper you on it getting knowledge more you know or else you who still having little bit of digest in
reading this Building Your Ideal Private Practice: A Guide for Therapists and Other Healing Professionals
can be the light food in your case because the information inside this particular book is easy to get by simply
anyone. These books produce itself in the form that is reachable by anyone, that's why I mean in the e-book
form. People who think that in reserve form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this publication is the answer.
So there is absolutely no in reading a e-book especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It
should be here for anyone. So , don't miss this! Just read this e-book sort for your better life and also
knowledge.

Thomas Towne:

You will get this Building Your Ideal Private Practice: A Guide for Therapists and Other Healing
Professionals by look at the bookstore or Mall. Merely viewing or reviewing it can to be your solve
challenge if you get difficulties on your knowledge. Kinds of this publication are various. Not only simply by



written or printed and also can you enjoy this book by simply e-book. In the modern era just like now, you
just looking of your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your current ways to
get more information about your guide. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your
knowledge are still up-date. Let's try to choose proper ways for you.
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