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Following China's entry into the WTO in September 2001, it has been keen to establish itself among trading
parties as a market economy. In recent years it has become one of the largest trading nations in the world,
and is a source of substantial inward investment. In recognition of these developments, the government has
undertaken a major overhaul and modernization of its competition law, superseding the outdated and
disparate provisions previously in place, with new legislation in 2007. China's near neighbors, Vietnam and
South Korea, likewise have vibrant economies and have had strong trading relationships with the west for
many years. This book is the first to cover the practical implications of the developments in competition law
in these countries.

It is aimed at practicing lawyers and company advisors, giving a clear description of the new antitrust law in
China, the established antitrust law in Taiwan and Korea, and the underdeveloped law in Vietnam. It also
considers developments in Hong Kong, which is in the process of introducing a general law of antitrust. The
first part of the book gives a concise introduction to antitrust laws and policies in the jurisdictions covered, as
well as an introduction to standards in antitrust law for those new to the area. China, Taiwan, Korea and
Vietnam each have five chapters devoted to discussion of the regime in general, its institutional shape, the
substantive laws relating to agreements, dominant or monopoly firm conduct, merger control and procedures.
The relevant legislation is explained and the principles clarified by references to guidelines, practice and
relevant decisions and cases. In the case of Hong Kong a single chapter discusses the proposals brought
forward by the legislature. Particular attention is paid to the extent to which antitrust laws in each jurisdiction
may be applied to parties who are not citizens in those jurisdictions.

This book is invaluable to lawyers advising clients engaging in international trade and commerce with and
within these territories, and besides giving a clear explanation of the position of the law, it also contains
translations of the core relevant legislation for each of the jurisdictions. Academics specializing in
international competition law will find this a concise and informative text for consultation.
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From reader reviews:

Susanne Pineda:

The book Antitrust Law in China, Korea and Vietnam make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You need to
use to make your capable far more increase. Book can to become your best friend when you getting tension
or having big problem along with your subject. If you can make looking at a book Antitrust Law in China,
Korea and Vietnam to become your habit, you can get much more advantages, like add your current capable,
increase your knowledge about several or all subjects. You could know everything if you like open up and
read a guide Antitrust Law in China, Korea and Vietnam. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science
book or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think about this publication?

Shirley Arrington:

What do you regarding book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you need
something to explain what you problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy particular person? If
you don't have spare time to do others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have extra time?
What did you do? Every person has many questions above. They have to answer that question because just
their can do that. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is appropriate. Because
start from on pre-school until university need this kind of Antitrust Law in China, Korea and Vietnam to
read.

Sophia Morrison:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the name Antitrust Law in
China, Korea and Vietnam suitable to you? The book was written by renowned writer in this era. The
particular book untitled Antitrust Law in China, Korea and Vietnamis the main of several books that
everyone read now. That book was inspired lots of people in the world. When you read this publication you
will enter the new shape that you ever know just before. The author explained their idea in the simple way,
and so all of people can easily to comprehend the core of this book. This book will give you a wide range of
information about this world now. So you can see the represented of the world on this book.

Catherine Hershey:

Beside this specific Antitrust Law in China, Korea and Vietnam in your phone, it might give you a way to
get closer to the new knowledge or facts. The information and the knowledge you will got here is fresh
through the oven so don't end up being worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow commune. It is
good thing to have Antitrust Law in China, Korea and Vietnam because this book offers to you readable
information. Do you sometimes have book but you rarely get what it's about. Oh come on, that would not
happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable set up here cannot be questionable, such as treasuring
beautiful island. So do you still want to miss the item? Find this book in addition to read it from currently!
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