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A comprehensive guide for business people, government administrators and specialists in management
methodology, Methodological School of Management details the original and applied thinking, methods and
approaches established by the school in the Soviet era and still operating successfully in modern Russia
today.

The Methodological School of Management is not an educational institution, but a range of management
tools, which evolved as a part of the 'systems movement' during the second half of the twentieth century. The
school was created by the pupils of Georgy Petrovich Shchedrovitsky (1929–1994) under whose leadership a
body of knowledge – the 'starting capital' of the Methodological School of Management – took shape. The
management tools developed by the school are used by its leaders in their current managerial practice. This
practice extends to a number of fields: government administration, management of economic sectors,
corporate governance and the management of individual corporations.

Although the school is less well known to Western specialists in systems engineering methodology and
management, this book aims to secure the school a place in the global systems engineering landscape. Its
ideas have entered the tool kits of most major control systems and corporations in the world's leading
economies, from NASA and Toyota to retail chains – a clear testimony to the value of Georgy
Shchedrovitsky's research, ideas and the body of knowledge he left behind.

Shortlisted for the CMI Management Book of the Year award, Methodological School of Management offers
solutions for resolving tricky managerial situations and achieving organisational targets – essential reading
for anyone learning how to manage people and issues alike.
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From reader reviews:

Clyde Welch:

This Methodological School of Management tend to be reliable for you who want to be a successful person,
why. The key reason why of this Methodological School of Management can be one of many great books
you must have is actually giving you more than just simple looking at food but feed you actually with
information that maybe will shock your before knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it
everywhere you go and whenever your conditions at e-book and printed types. Beside that this
Methodological School of Management giving you an enormous of experience including rich vocabulary,
giving you test of critical thinking that could it useful in your day task. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Jon Gomes:

This book untitled Methodological School of Management to be one of several books that will best seller in
this year, that's because when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy
this particular book in the book retail store or you can order it by means of online. The publisher of this book
sells the e-book too. It makes you more readily to read this book, as you can read this book in your
Smartphone. So there is no reason to you to past this e-book from your list.

Jason Young:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their free time with their
family, or their friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, likely to beach, or picnic
from the park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something
different to fill your own free time/ holiday? May be reading a book may be option to fill your free time/
holiday. The first thing you ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want to try out look
for book, may be the reserve untitled Methodological School of Management can be very good book to read.
May be it could be best activity to you.

Richard Sauls:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book particularly book
entitled Methodological School of Management the mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering
in every single aspect that maybe unidentified for but surely can become your mind friends. Imaging each
word written in a book then become one web form conclusion and explanation which maybe you never get
before. The Methodological School of Management giving you a different experience more than blown away
your thoughts but also giving you useful information for your better life in this particular era. So now let us
present to you the relaxing pattern this is your body and mind will likely be pleased when you are finished
looking at it, like winning a casino game. Do you want to try this extraordinary paying spare time activity?
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