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Have you ever driven through a small town with an intriguing name like Wyandotte or Cuyamungue and
wondered where that name came from? Or how such well-known placenames as Tucson, Waco, or Tulsa
originated?

Native American placenames like these occur all across the American Southwest. This user-friendly
guide—covering Arizona, New Mexico, Oklahoma, and Texas—provides fascinating information about the
meaning and origins of southwestern placenames. With its unique regional approach and compact design, the
handbook is especially suitable for curious travelers.

Written by distinguished linguist William Bright, the handbook is organized alphabetically, and its entries
for places—including towns, cities, counties, parks, and geographic landmarks—are concise and easy to
read. Entries give the state and county, along with all available information on pronunciation, the name of
the language from which the name derives, the name’s literal meaning, and relevant history.In their
introduction to the handbook, editors Alice Anderton and Sean O’Neill provide easy-to-understand
pronunciation keys for English and Native languages. They further explain basic linguistic terminology and
common southwestern geographical terms such as mesa, canyon, and barranca.

The book also features maps showing all counties in each of the southwestern states, a list of Native
languages and language families, and contact information for tribal headquarters throughout the Southwest.
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From reader reviews:

Denise Dennis:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always try and and must have the extra time or they will get wide
range of stress from both day to day life and work. So , once we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely yes. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity do you
have when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you try this
one, reading guides. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, the actual book you have
read is Native American Placenames of the Southwest: A Handbook for Travelers.

Gregory Goolsby:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray anyone, why because this Native American Placenames of the
Southwest: A Handbook for Travelers guide written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to
make book that can be understand by anyone who have read the book. Written inside good manner for you,
leaking every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still skepticism Native
American Placenames of the Southwest: A Handbook for Travelers as good book not only by the cover but
also with the content. This is one publication that can break don't assess book by its handle, so do you still
needing yet another sixth sense to pick this particular!? Oh come on your examining sixth sense already said
so why you have to listening to yet another sixth sense.

Jonathan Hickman:

Is it an individual who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day through watching television
programs or just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Native American
Placenames of the Southwest: A Handbook for Travelers can be the response, oh how comes? A book you
know. You are and so out of date, spending your spare time by reading in this completely new era is
common not a nerd activity. So what these publications have than the others?

Scott Harrington:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This particular book Native American Placenames of the
Southwest: A Handbook for Travelers was bright colored and of course has pictures around. As we know
that book Native American Placenames of the Southwest: A Handbook for Travelers has many kinds or
category. Start from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or Private eye Conan you can read and feel
that you are the character on there. So , not at all of book usually are make you bored, any it offers up you
feel happy, fun and loosen up. Try to choose the best book for you and try to like reading that.
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