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To say that the writings of St. Francis reflect his personality and his spirit is but another way of saying that
they are at once formidably mystic and exquisitely human; that they combine great elevation of thought with
much picturesqueness of expression.
This twofold element, which found its development later on in the prose of mystics like St. Bonaventure and
in the verse of poets like Jacopone da Todi, and which has ever been a marked characteristic of Franciscan
ascetic literature, leads back to the writings of the Founder as to the humble upper waters of a mighty stream.
St. Francis had the soul of an ascetic and the heart of a poet. His unbounded faith had an almost lyric
sweetness about it; his deep sense of the spiritual is often clothed with the character of romance. This
intimate union of the supernatural and the natural is nowhere more strikingly manifested than in the writings
of St. Francis, which, after the vicissitudes of well nigh seven hundred winters, are still fragrant with the
fragrance of the Seraphic springtide.
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From reader reviews:

Barbara Clarke:

The guide with title The Wisdom of St. Francis of Assisi contains a lot of information that you can
understand it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. This specific book exist new information the
information that exist in this book represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u
to find out how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you within new era of the globalization.
You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.

Micheal Mata:

The Wisdom of St. Francis of Assisi can be one of your starter books that are good idea. Most of us
recommend that straight away because this e-book has good vocabulary that could increase your knowledge
in terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information. The article author
giving his/her effort to put every word into delight arrangement in writing The Wisdom of St. Francis of
Assisi yet doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader the hottest in addition to based confirm resource
facts that maybe you can be certainly one of it. This great information can certainly drawn you into brand
new stage of crucial imagining.

Cassandra Giron:

Is it you actually who having spare time after that spend it whole day by simply watching television
programs or just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This The Wisdom of St.
Francis of Assisi can be the reply, oh how comes? A book you know. You are and so out of date, spending
your spare time by reading in this brand-new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these ebooks have
than the others?

Lori Gonzales:

You may get this The Wisdom of St. Francis of Assisi by go to the bookstore or Mall. Merely viewing or
reviewing it could possibly to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds of this
e-book are various. Not only through written or printed and also can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the
modern era like now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now,
choose your own personal ways to get more information about your e-book. It is most important to arrange
yourself to make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose appropriate ways for you.
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