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Measuring Ocean Currents: Tools, Technologies, and Data covers all major aspects of ocean current
measurements in view of the implications of ocean currents on changing climate, increasing pollution levels,
and offshore engineering activities. Although more than 70% of the Earth is covered by ocean, there is
limited information on the countless fine- to large-scale water motions taking place within them. This book
fills that information gap as the first work that summarizes the state-of-the-art methods and instruments used
for surface, subsurface, and abyssal ocean current measurements.

Readers of this book will find a wealth of information on Lagrangian measurements, horizontal mapping,
imaging, Eulerian measurements, and vertical profiling techniques. In addition, the book describes modern
technologies for remote measurement of ocean currents and their signatures, including HF Doppler radar
systems, satellite-borne sensors, ocean acoustic tomography, and more. Crucial aspects of ocean currents are
described in detail as well, including dispersion of effluents discharged into the sea and transport of
beneficial materials—as well as environmentally hazardous materials—from one region to another. The book
highlights several important practical applications, showing how measurements relate to climate change and
pollution levels, how they affect coastal and offshore engineering activities, and how they can aid in tsunami
detection.

Coverage of measurement, mapping and profiling techniques●

Descriptions of technologies for remote measurement of ocean currents and their signatures●

Reviews crucial aspects of ocean currents, including special emphasis on the planet-spanning thermohaline●

circulation, known as the ocean's "conveyor belt," and its crucial role in climate change
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From reader reviews:

Regina Rodgers:

This Measuring Ocean Currents: Tools, Technologies, and Data book is simply not ordinary book, you have
it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is usually information inside
this reserve incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information
you will get. This Measuring Ocean Currents: Tools, Technologies, and Data without we realize teach the
one who reading it become critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't end up being worry Measuring Ocean
Currents: Tools, Technologies, and Data can bring whenever you are and not make your tote space or
bookshelves' turn into full because you can have it in your lovely laptop even telephone. This Measuring
Ocean Currents: Tools, Technologies, and Data having very good arrangement in word and layout, so you
will not experience uninterested in reading.

Virginia Boone:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you actually, why because this Measuring Ocean Currents: Tools,
Technologies, and Data book written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book that
can be understand by anyone who have read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, still
dripping wet every ideas and composing skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still
hesitation Measuring Ocean Currents: Tools, Technologies, and Data as good book not just by the cover but
also with the content. This is one e-book that can break don't evaluate book by its handle, so do you still
needing yet another sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already alerted
you so why you have to listening to an additional sixth sense.

Melissa Parra:

You could spend your free time to learn this book this book. This Measuring Ocean Currents: Tools,
Technologies, and Data is simple bringing you can read it in the playground, in the beach, train as well as
soon. If you did not include much space to bring typically the printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It
is make you much easier to read it. You can save the actual book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of
benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Rod Doughty:

As a scholar exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library as well as
to make summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's internal or real
their pastime. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to go to the library. They go to presently there
but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring and also can't see
colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we know
that on this period, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore , this Measuring Ocean Currents: Tools, Technologies, and Data can make you really feel



more interested to read.
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