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Modernity dissolves absolute certainties; late modernity dissolves them absolutely. In the modern world
system there appears to be no firm, unchallenged ground on which to construct a meaningful canopy. But
around the world, many individuals and groups long for a kind of cultural coherence that they believe once
existed. They search for fundamentals. While these may be sought in religious traditions, many also aspire to
new secular certainties. In their various new forms and contexts the contemporary quests for meaning in turn
transform the societies in which they occur. The rich comparative examples in The Search for Fundamentals
are used to analyze the sources and consequences of several cultural movements. The book also offers
theoretical reflections on the difficulties they experience and on the message they carry for students of
modernity.
Audience: A broad readership of scholars and advanced students in the social sciences and humanities.
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From reader reviews:

Stephen Stover:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing for us
to learn everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or maybe goal; it means that reserve has
different type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They are really
reading whatever they have because their hobby will be reading a book. How about the person who don't like
examining a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book after they found difficult problem or even
exercise. Well, probably you will want this The Search for Fundamentals: The Process of Modernisation and
the Quest for Meaning.

William Mayer:

Book is usually written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
e-book. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important factor to bring us around the
world. Adjacent to that you can your reading skill was fluently. A e-book The Search for Fundamentals: The
Process of Modernisation and the Quest for Meaning will make you to become smarter. You can feel much
more confidence if you can know about every thing. But some of you think this open or reading some sort of
book make you bored. It isn't make you fun. Why they can be thought like that? Have you seeking best book
or appropriate book with you?

Raymond Blalock:

The feeling that you get from The Search for Fundamentals: The Process of Modernisation and the Quest for
Meaning may be the more deep you digging the information that hide inside the words the more you get
considering reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to be aware of but The Search for Fundamentals:
The Process of Modernisation and the Quest for Meaning giving you buzz feeling of reading. The writer
conveys their point in particular way that can be understood by anyone who read the item because the author
of this e-book is well-known enough. This book also makes your current vocabulary increase well. It is
therefore easy to understand then can go with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We highly
recommend you for having this specific The Search for Fundamentals: The Process of Modernisation and the
Quest for Meaning instantly.

Jose Gower:

With this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability in doing something more are more
valuable than other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you
are related is just spending your time little but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. One of several
books in the top listing in your reading list will be The Search for Fundamentals: The Process of
Modernisation and the Quest for Meaning. This book which is qualified as The Hungry Mountains can get
you closer in growing to be precious person. By looking right up and review this book you can get many



advantages.
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