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As Italy emerged from World War II, the first women entered the national government. The 45 women who
became parliamentarians when Italian women were first entitled to vote in 1946 represented a "lost wave" of
feminist action, argues Molly Tambor.

In this work, Tambor reconstructs the role that these female politicians played in Italy's new democratic
Republic. They proved critical in ensuring that the new Constitution formally guaranteed the equality of all
citizens regardless of sex, translating the general constitutional guarantees into direct legislative rights and
protections. They used a specific electoral and legislative strategy, "constitutional rights feminism," to
construct an image of the female citizen as a bulwark of democracy. Mining existing tropes of femininity
such as the Resistance heroine, the working mother, the sacrificial Catholic, and the "mamma Italiana," they
searched for social consensus for women's equality that could reach across religious, ideological, and gender
divides. The political biographies of woman politicians are intertwined with the history of the laws they
created and helped pass, including paid maternity leave, the closing of state-run brothels, and women's right
to become judges.

Women politicians navigated gendered political identity as they picked and chose among competing models
of femininity in Cold War Italy. In so doing, The Lost Wave shows, they forged a political legacy that
affected the rights and opportunities of all Italian citizens.
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From reader reviews:

William Reynolds:

What do you consider book? It is just for students because they are still students or the idea for all people in
the world, what best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that question above. Every person has
different personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they don't
wish do that. You must know how great along with important the book The Lost Wave: Women and
Democracy in Postwar Italy. All type of book would you see on many methods. You can look for the internet
methods or other social media.

Albert Gilchrist:

This book untitled The Lost Wave: Women and Democracy in Postwar Italy to be one of several books in
which best seller in this year, that is because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit upon
it. You will easily to buy that book in the book retail store or you can order it by way of online. The
publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to read this book, because you can read this
book in your Mobile phone. So there is no reason for your requirements to past this book from your list.

Sophia Hartman:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book particularly book entitled The
Lost Wave: Women and Democracy in Postwar Italy your brain will drift away trough every dimension,
wandering in every aspect that maybe unknown for but surely might be your mind friends. Imaging just
about every word written in a guide then become one contact form conclusion and explanation that will
maybe you never get just before. The The Lost Wave: Women and Democracy in Postwar Italy giving you
one more experience more than blown away your head but also giving you useful data for your better life in
this era. So now let us present to you the relaxing pattern is your body and mind is going to be pleased when
you are finished reading through it, like winning a casino game. Do you want to try this extraordinary
wasting spare time activity?

Agatha Draper:

That guide can make you to feel relax. That book The Lost Wave: Women and Democracy in Postwar Italy
was vibrant and of course has pictures around. As we know that book The Lost Wave: Women and
Democracy in Postwar Italy has many kinds or style. Start from kids until teenagers. For example Naruto or
Detective Conan you can read and feel that you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book are
generally make you bored, any it makes you feel happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best book to suit your
needs and try to like reading that will.
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