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John Griffith "Jack" London was born John Griffith Chaney on January 12th, 1876 in San Francisco. His
father, William Chaney, was living with his mother Flora Wellman when she became pregnant. Chaney
insisted she have an abortion. Flora's response was to turn a gun on herself. Although her wounds were not
severe the trauma made her temporarily deranged. In late 1876 his mother married John London and the
young child was brought to live with them as they moved around the Bay area, eventually settling in Oakland
where Jack completed grade school. Jack also worked hard at several jobs, sometimes 12-18 hours a day, but
his dream was university. He was lent money for that and after intense studying enrolled in the summer of
1896 at the University of California in Berkeley. In 1897, at 21 , Jack searched out newspaper accounts of
his mother's suicide attempt and the name of his biological father. He wrote to William Chaney, then living
in Chicago. Chaney said he could not be London's father because he was impotent; and casually asserted that
London's mother had relations with other men. Jack, devastated by the response, quit Berkeley and went to
the Klondike. Though equally because of his continuing dire finances Jack might have taken that as the
excuse he needed to leave. In the Klondike Jack began to gather material for his writing but also accumulated
many health problems, including scurvy, hip and leg problems many of which he then carried for life. By the
late 1890's Jack was regularly publishing short stories and by the turn of the century full blown novels. By
1904 Jack had married, fathered two children and was now in the process of divorcing. A stint as a reporter
on the Russo-Japanese war of 1904 was equal amounts trouble and experience. But that experience was
always put to good use in a remarkable output of work. Twelve years later Jack had amassed a wealth of
writings many of which remain world classics. He had a reputation as a social activist and a tireless friend of
the workers. And yet on November 22nd 1916 Jack London died in a cottage on his ranch at the age of only
40. Here we present Lost Face.
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From reader reviews:

Danielle Rhodes:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information presently can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a expertise or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider while those information which is inside former life are challenging to be find than now could be
taking seriously which one is appropriate to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you get
the unstable resource then you obtain it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All
of those possibilities will not happen with you if you take Lost Face: "It's better to stand by someone's side
than by yourself" as the daily resource information.

Jonathan Woods:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world could share their idea.
Publications can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire their particular reader with their story
or even their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the ebooks. But also they write about advantage
about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach children, there are
many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on earth always try to improve their skill in writing, they
also doing some study before they write to their book. One of them is this Lost Face: "It's better to stand by
someone's side than by yourself".

Craig Brown:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them
friends and family or their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just
watching TV, or perhaps playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity here is
look different you can read some sort of book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you just
read you can spent 24 hours a day to reading a book. The book Lost Face: "It's better to stand by someone's
side than by yourself" it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot of those who recommended this
book. They were enjoying reading this book. When you did not have enough space to create this book you
can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore simply to read this book from your smart phone. The price is not
too costly but this book provides high quality.

Leah Humphries:

In this era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more treasured than
other. Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What you should do is just
spending your time little but quite enough to get a look at some books. Among the books in the top listing in
your reading list is Lost Face: "It's better to stand by someone's side than by yourself". This book which can
be qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in turning out to be precious person. By looking up



and review this book you can get many advantages.
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