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Dataviz—the new language of business

A good visualization can communicate the nature and potential impact of information and ideas more
powerfully than any other form of communication.

For a long time “dataviz” was left to specialists—data scientists and professional designers. No longer. A
new generation of tools and massive amounts of available data make it easy for anyone to create
visualizations that communicate ideas far more effectively than generic spreadsheet charts ever could.

What’s more, building good charts is quickly becoming a need-to-have skill for managers. If you’re not
doing it, other managers are, and they’re getting noticed for it and getting credit for contributing to your
company’s success.

In Good Charts, dataviz maven Scott Berinato provides an essential guide to how visualization works and
how to use this new language to impress and persuade. Dataviz today is where spreadsheets and word
processors were in the early 1980s—on the cusp of changing how we work. Berinato lays out a system for
thinking visually and building better charts through a process of talking, sketching, and prototyping.

This book is much more than a set of static rules for making visualizations. It taps into both well-established
and cutting-edge research in visual perception and neuroscience, as well as the emerging field of
visualization science, to explore why good charts (and bad ones) create “feelings behind our eyes.” Along
the way, Berinato also includes many engaging vignettes of dataviz pros, illustrating the ideas in practice.

Good Charts will help you turn plain, uninspiring charts that merely present information into smart, effective
visualizations that powerfully convey ideas.
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From reader reviews:

Frances Small:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students because they are still students or this for all people in the
world, what the best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that query above. Every person
has different personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that
they don't wish do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Good Charts: The HBR
Guide to Making Smarter, More Persuasive Data Visualizations. All type of book are you able to see on
many options. You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Virginia Carter:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with pals is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try factor that really opposite
from that. One particular activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you are ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Good Charts: The HBR Guide to
Making Smarter, More Persuasive Data Visualizations, you can enjoy both. It is excellent combination right,
you still want to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout people. What? Still
don't get it, oh come on its referred to as reading friends.

Valerie Orbison:

The book untitled Good Charts: The HBR Guide to Making Smarter, More Persuasive Data Visualizations
contain a lot of information on this. The writer explains the girl idea with easy technique. The language is
very clear and understandable all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was
compiled by famous author. The author will take you in the new time of literary works. You can easily read
this book because you can read more your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book in anywhere
and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can open up their official web-site along with order it. Have
a nice study.

Joseph Southard:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Good Charts: The HBR Guide to Making
Smarter, More Persuasive Data Visualizations was multi-colored and of course has pictures around. As we
know that book Good Charts: The HBR Guide to Making Smarter, More Persuasive Data Visualizations has
many kinds or type. Start from kids until teens. For example Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and
believe you are the character on there. So , not at all of book tend to be make you bored, any it offers you
feel happy, fun and unwind. Try to choose the best book for you personally and try to like reading which.
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