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A practical, step-by-step guide to Maya 2012

This book is the ideal primer to getting started with Maya, the premier 3D animation and effects software
used in movies, visual effects, games, cartoons, short films, and commercials. You'll learn the Maya
interface and the basics of modeling, texturing, animating, and visual effects. Professional visual effects
artist and instructor Dariush Derakhshani explains the nuances of the complex software, while creative
tutorials offer realistic, professional challenges for those new to 3D. You'll be up and running in no time with
the world's most popular professional 3D software application.

Provides a thorough, step-by-step introduction to Maya 2012●

Explains the core concepts of CG and working in 3D●

Covers modeling, rigging, HDRI lighting, mental ray rendering, and more●

Concepts are reinforced with tutorials that offer realistic challenges and clear explanations●

Color insert provides real-world examples from talented beginning Maya users●

Build your Maya and animation skills from the ground up with this practical, thorough guide.
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From reader reviews:

Henry Evans:

What do you about book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you require something to
explain what the ones you have problem? How about your time? Or are you busy man or woman? If you
don't have spare time to try and do others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And you
have extra time? What did you do? Every person has many questions above. They have to answer that
question mainly because just their can do that. It said that about book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes,
it is appropriate. Because start from on pre-school until university need that Introducing Autodesk Maya
2012 to read.

Myra Coronado:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be revise about what going on or info even
knowledge to make these individuals keep up with the era which is always change and advance. Some of you
maybe may update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems
coming to a person is you don't know what type you should start with. This Introducing Autodesk Maya
2012 is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves what
you want and wish in this era.

James Newman:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind skill or
thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book when compared with can
satisfy your small amount of time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find book that
need more time to be go through. Introducing Autodesk Maya 2012 can be your answer as it can be read by
anyone who have those short time problems.

Randy Jones:

Many people spending their time by playing outside with friends, fun activity having family or just watching
TV the whole day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by reading through a book. Ugh,
think reading a book can really hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It okay you can have
the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Introducing Autodesk Maya 2012 which
is finding the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's notice.
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