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Leverage the full power of Avid Media Composer with this essential guide from an Avid guru. Master
timesaving tricks and techniques that utilize the latest Media Composer features and state-of-the-art
workflows. Learn the secrets of the postproduction professionals from box office blockbusters like Harry
Potter, I am Legend, Dark Shadows, Men in Black II, Charlie’s Angels, 42, and The Last of the Mohicans, as
well as primetime hits like SMASH, Big Bang Theory, Weeds, The Mindy Project, and MythBusters.

In Avid Uncut, Steve Hullfish taps into the expertise of the world’s top editors to share in-depth, behind-the-
scenes secrets and best practices that will boost your editing and color correction skills to the next level. Five
distinct sections cover:

Pre-post, including discussion of metadata, prepping ScriptSync, decomposing, and more●

Settings, with tips on keyboard optimization, bin settings, and import/export settings●

Off-line workflows on trimming, multicam editing, using Phrasefind, audio, and stereoscopic 3D●

Effects, such as 3rd party plugins, 3D warp effects, and Animatte●

On-line workflows for efficiently and beautifully finishing your work, including step-by-step tutorials for●

RED and ARRI Alexa workflows

Also featured are extensive tips dedicated to helping FCP editors switch over to Avid, as well as a
companion website (www.focalpress.com/cw/hullfish) loaded with video tutorials of the techniques
discussed in the book and project files, including RED and ARRI Alexa footage, that turn Avid Uncut into an
invaluable, hands-on workshop!
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From reader reviews:

Jeffrey Brown:

What do you think about book? It is just for students because they're still students or the idea for all people in
the world, what the best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that concern above. Every
person has different personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they
don't would like do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Avid Uncut:
Workflows, Tips, and Techniques from Hollywood Pros. All type of book would you see on many options.
You can look for the internet sources or other social media.

David Martin:

This book untitled Avid Uncut: Workflows, Tips, and Techniques from Hollywood Pros to be one of several
books which best seller in this year, that is because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit
onto it. You will easily to buy this book in the book store or you can order it by means of online. The
publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, as you can read this
book in your Touch screen phone. So there is no reason to you to past this publication from your list.

Willie Hickox:

Avid Uncut: Workflows, Tips, and Techniques from Hollywood Pros can be one of your basic books that are
good idea. All of us recommend that straight away because this e-book has good vocabulary that could
increase your knowledge in words, easy to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information.
The writer giving his/her effort to set every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing Avid Uncut:
Workflows, Tips, and Techniques from Hollywood Pros although doesn't forget the main stage, giving the
reader the hottest in addition to based confirm resource info that maybe you can be among it. This great
information may drawn you into completely new stage of crucial pondering.

Susan Bondurant:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray anyone, why because this Avid Uncut: Workflows, Tips, and
Techniques from Hollywood Pros guide written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make
book that could be understand by anyone who read the book. Written with good manner for you, dripping
every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still skepticism Avid
Uncut: Workflows, Tips, and Techniques from Hollywood Pros as good book not merely by the cover but
also by the content. This is one guide that can break don't ascertain book by its include, so do you still
needing an additional sixth sense to pick this particular!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense already told
you so why you have to listening to an additional sixth sense.
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