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A research-based approach to achieving long-term profitability in business

What does it take to guarantee success and profitability over time? Authors Christopher G. Worley, a senior
research scientist, Thomas D. Williams, an executive advisor, and Edward E. Lawler III, one of the country's
leading management experts, set out to find the answer. In The Agility Factor: Building Adaptable
Organizations for Superior Performance the authors reveal the factors that drive long-term profitability
based on the practices of successful companies that have consistently outperformed their peers. Of the 234
large companies across 18 industries that were studied, there were few companies that delivered sustained
performance across the board. The authors found that across industries, the most successful companies were
not the "usual suspects" found in the media, but companies who possessed a quiet agility that allowed them
to quickly perceive and respond to changes so that they could continue to grow. Agility gives organizations
the ability to adapt to fluctuations in the environment, test possible responses, and implement changes
quickly. This book offers specific, research-based case studies to help organizational leaders use agility to
achieve sustained profitability and performance while also becoming more adaptable to a changing
marketplace.

For executives, leaders, consultants, board members and all those responsible for the long-term health of
organizations, this insightful guide outlines:

The components of agility for business organizations●

How to successfully build agility within an organization●

How agility has its foundation in good management practices●

How to use agility to gain a competitive advantage in the marketplace●
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From reader reviews:

Joseph Anderson:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to find out everything in the world. Each book has different aim or maybe goal; it means that
book has different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They may be
reading whatever they consider because their hobby will be reading a book. How about the person who don't
like examining a book? Sometime, man feel need book once they found difficult problem or exercise. Well,
probably you will require this The Agility Factor: Building Adaptable Organizations for Superior
Performance.

Frances Carpenter:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Sure, you can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their very own
spare time to take a stroll, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open as well as read a book
entitled The Agility Factor: Building Adaptable Organizations for Superior Performance? Maybe it is to
become best activity for you. You know beside you can spend your time together with your favorite's book,
you can smarter than before. Do you agree with the opinion or you have additional opinion?

Olga Snider:

Now a day folks who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not require people to be aware of each details they get. How people have to be
smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Reading through a
book can help individuals out of this uncertainty Information especially this The Agility Factor: Building
Adaptable Organizations for Superior Performance book since this book offers you rich data and knowledge.
Of course the info in this book hundred pct guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Kenneth Copeland:

A number of people said that they feel bored when they reading a guide. They are directly felt the idea when
they get a half portions of the book. You can choose the particular book The Agility Factor: Building
Adaptable Organizations for Superior Performance to make your reading is interesting. Your current skill of
reading expertise is developing when you including reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you
enjoy to see it and mingle the impression about book and studying especially. It is to be very first opinion for
you to like to open up a book and go through it. Beside that the publication The Agility Factor: Building
Adaptable Organizations for Superior Performance can to be your friend when you're truly feel alone and
confuse in doing what must you're doing of their time.
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