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IS THIS YOUR CHILD?

These are the major symptoms of potentially unrecognized allergies. Does your child suffer from any of the
following?

• Allergic Nose Rub • Eye Circles • Red Ears • Red Cheeks • Eye Wrinkles • Aggression • Lack of Alertness
• Mottled Tongue •

In this breakthrough book, Dr. Doris Rapp offers a simple yet effective approach to handling "problem"
children. Is This Your Child? shows parents how to identify the common foods, chemicals, or common
allergic substances that could be the culprits that cause some children or adults to feel unwell or act
inappropriately. If your child is always sick, hyperactive, a slow learner, or cranky, the first question you
should ask is not "What drug should be prescribed?" or "What have I done wrong as a parent?" Instead, find
out the cause.

Dr. Rapp gives sensible suggestions about how these reactions to foods and environmental factors can be
recognized, prevented, and treated. With this information, many affected children should feel, act, behave,
and learn better. If you can detect unsuspected environmental illness in your child--or yourself--you can
change your lives so you're more content, happy, and free of illness.
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From reader reviews:

Katie Doll:

The book Is This Your Child? can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. So just
why must we leave the great thing like a book Is This Your Child?? Several of you have a different opinion
about guide. But one aim in which book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to
closer with the book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, you may give for each other; you may
share all of these. Book Is This Your Child? has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and big
function for you. You can look the enormous world by open up and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

William Stewart:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information presently can get by anyone in everywhere.
The information can be a know-how or any news even an issue. What people must be consider if those
information which is within the former life are challenging to be find than now's taking seriously which one
would work to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you get the unstable resource then
you buy it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All of those possibilities will
not happen inside you if you take Is This Your Child? as your daily resource information.

Mark Whitten:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book mainly book entitled Is
This Your Child? your head will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every aspect that maybe
not known for but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging every single word written in a reserve then
become one contact form conclusion and explanation which maybe you never get before. The Is This Your
Child? giving you a different experience more than blown away your mind but also giving you useful facts
for your better life in this particular era. So now let us demonstrate the relaxing pattern this is your body and
mind will probably be pleased when you are finished reading through it, like winning a sport. Do you want to
try this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

Susan Bondurant:

Is This Your Child? can be one of your nice books that are good idea. Many of us recommend that straight
away because this e-book has good vocabulary that can increase your knowledge in vocabulary, easy to
understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The copy writer giving his/her effort
to put every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing Is This Your Child? although doesn't forget the
main stage, giving the reader the hottest along with based confirm resource facts that maybe you can be one
among it. This great information may drawn you into brand-new stage of crucial contemplating.
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