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This edited volume brings together scholars positioned in and outside of China, including former Chinese
journalists, in a comprehensive and in-depth study of Chinese investigative journalists’ dreams, work
practices, and strategies. It is the first book that systematically addresses the roles and values of Chinese
investigative journalists in different types of media, in the process addressing topics such as journalism
education, different generations and sub-groups among investigative journalists, and gendered roles within
investigative journalism.

The book discusses journalists’ relations with the state and issues of political control and censorship but
seeks to unpack the state by looking at different administrative levels, institutions and geographical
locations. Furthermore, the authors acknowledge and analyze how investigative journalism today is shaped,
constrained and negotiated through contacts with other actors than the state, including companies, civil
society, and the audience. The book sheds light on the possibilities and restrictions for more critical
journalism in an authoritarian regime.
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From reader reviews:

Hallie Cathey:

The knowledge that you get from Chinese Investigative Journalists' Dreams: Autonomy, Agency, and Voice
is the more deep you looking the information that hide within the words the more you get serious about
reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to know but Chinese Investigative Journalists' Dreams:
Autonomy, Agency, and Voice giving you joy feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in certain
way that can be understood by anyone who read the idea because the author of this book is well-known
enough. This kind of book also makes your vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go
together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We highly recommend you for having this
kind of Chinese Investigative Journalists' Dreams: Autonomy, Agency, and Voice instantly.

Teresa Jones:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information currently can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even an issue. What people must be
consider if those information which is inside former life are challenging be find than now is taking seriously
which one is acceptable to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you get the unstable resource
then you get it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will
not happen throughout you if you take Chinese Investigative Journalists' Dreams: Autonomy, Agency, and
Voice as the daily resource information.

Harold Walsh:

The e-book untitled Chinese Investigative Journalists' Dreams: Autonomy, Agency, and Voice is the
publication that recommended to you to study. You can see the quality of the book content that will be
shown to you. The language that creator use to explained their way of doing something is easily to
understand. The writer was did a lot of exploration when write the book, so the information that they share
for your requirements is absolutely accurate. You also will get the e-book of Chinese Investigative
Journalists' Dreams: Autonomy, Agency, and Voice from the publisher to make you considerably more enjoy
free time.

Jonathan Leake:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their spare time with their family, or their
friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, gonna beach, or picnic inside the park.
They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different to fill your own
personal free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book is usually option to fill your totally free time/ holiday.
The first thing you will ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want to try out look for
book, may be the publication untitled Chinese Investigative Journalists' Dreams: Autonomy, Agency, and
Voice can be great book to read. May be it is usually best activity to you.
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