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Ulterior Motives (Revised) is Volume 1 of the Maurice Ousley crime thriller series. Maurice Ousley was a
pro basketball star who had the lifestyle that most people dreamed of having, and he was on the cusp of
being an NBA superstar. He was the desire of women and the envy of men, but his good fortune was soon
about to drastically change for the worst. 

His team got bounced out of the NBA Playoffs, so he decided to come back to Chicago to visit his family
Mother's Day weekend. However, someone from his sordid past wanted some old-fashioned payback, so his
stepfather was kidnapped for a million dollar ransom. He had 48 hours to raise the money or else his
stepfather was dead. Will Maurice rescue his stepfather, or will the two of them fall victim to this band of
ruthless thugs? Ulterior Motives (Revised) is a cautionary tale that reveals things aren't always what they
seem to be. Take a journey into a world of lies, betrayal and murder.
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From reader reviews:

Mark McCarver:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important
thing for us to learn everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim as well as goal; it means that
reserve has different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They are
reading whatever they take because their hobby is reading a book. What about the person who don't like
examining a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book when they found difficult problem or exercise.
Well, probably you'll have this Ulterior Motives (Revised).

Arthur Atwood:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading practice give
you lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside the
book which improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of reserve you
read, if you want send more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want feel happy
read one together with theme for entertaining including comic or novel. The actual Ulterior Motives
(Revised) is kind of e-book which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Dennis Gaines:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or go to the outside with them friends and family
or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or perhaps
playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity that is look different you can read
the book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent 24 hours a
day to reading a publication. The book Ulterior Motives (Revised) it is very good to read. There are a lot of
folks that recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this book. When you did not have enough
space bringing this book you can buy the actual e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book through your
smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book has high quality.

David Gaiter:

Some individuals said that they feel fed up when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt the idea when
they get a half areas of the book. You can choose the book Ulterior Motives (Revised) to make your reading
is interesting. Your personal skill of reading skill is developing when you including reading. Try to choose
very simple book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the sensation about book and reading especially.
It is to be first opinion for you to like to open a book and study it. Beside that the e-book Ulterior Motives
(Revised) can to be your new friend when you're truly feel alone and confuse with what must you're doing of
this time.
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