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Vegemite is perhaps Australia’s most enduring cultural icon. But how did this pungent, salty black paste,
which for most of us is how we start the day, come to be created? Cyril Callister was a passionate scientist
and innovator, and his story is inextricably bound with that of our country through the first half of the
twentieth century, through two world wars and the Depression.

He was the grandson of a gold miner who arrived in Ballarat in the 1850s. His own father, a widower, raised
a small army of kids, and Cyril was the first to go to university. He was sent to England during WWI and in
the 1920s was employed by the flamboyant and entrepreneurial Fred Walker, charged with the task of
creating a substance that would, in time, be named Vegemite. Cyril remained at Kraft until his death in 1949.
He was a progressive boss and encouraged further training for all of his staff, many of them women.

Cyril was also a husband and father to three children – two were struck down by polio as children, while the
third, a fighter pilot, was tragically killed while on a dawn air sortie in the Trobriand Islands, east of PNG
during WWII. The Man Who Invented Vegemite is a must-read for all of us interested in remarkable
Australian stories. Jamie Callister, sets out to learn more about the grandfather he never met and, along the
way, discovers that extraordinary things can happen to (almost) ordinary people.
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From reader reviews:

Jose Gould:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the title The Man Who
Invented Vegemite suitable to you? Often the book was written by well-known writer in this era. Typically
the book untitled The Man Who Invented Vegemiteis the one of several books that will everyone read now.
This particular book was inspired many men and women in the world. When you read this reserve you will
enter the new shape that you ever know ahead of. The author explained their thought in the simple way,
consequently all of people can easily to know the core of this publication. This book will give you a lots of
information about this world now. To help you to see the represented of the world in this book.

Inez Tuller:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them
family or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV,
or perhaps playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity here is look different
you can read any book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent all day long
to reading a e-book. The book The Man Who Invented Vegemite it is rather good to read. There are a lot of
those who recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading this book. Should you did not have
enough space to deliver this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this
book from the smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book provides high quality.

Ruth Lynch:

In this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability to do something more are more special than
other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you have to
do is just spending your time almost no but quite enough to have a look at some books. Among the books in
the top checklist in your reading list is usually The Man Who Invented Vegemite. This book which is
qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in turning into precious person. By looking right up and
review this book you can get many advantages.

Ruby Harris:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got learners? We believe that that problem
was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. And you know
that little person like reading or as studying become their hobby. You must know that reading is very
important and also book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your own
teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update regarding something by book. Different categories of books
that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is actually The Man Who Invented Vegemite.
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