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An acknowledged expert on the Hebrew Bible, Thomas Dozeman offers a fresh translation of the Hebrew
and Greek texts of the book of Joshua and explores the nature, function, and causes of the religious violence
depicted therein. By blending the distinct teachings of Deuteronomy and the Priestly literature, Dozeman
provides a unique interpretation of holy war as a form of sacred genocide, arguing that, since peace in the
promised land required the elimination of the populations of all existent royal cities, a general purging of the
land accompanied the progress of the ark of the covenant. This essential work of religious scholarship
demonstrates how the theme of total genocide is reinterpreted as partial conquest when redactors place
Joshua, an independent book, between Deuteronomy and Judges. The author traces the evolution of this
reinterpretation of the central themes of religious violence while providing a comparison of the two textual
versions of Joshua and an insightful analysis of the book’s reception history.
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From reader reviews:

John Augustine:

Here thing why this specific Joshua 1-12: A New Translation with Introduction and Commentary (The
Anchor Yale Bible Commentaries) are different and reputable to be yours. First of all reading a book is good
nevertheless it depends in the content of it which is the content is as delicious as food or not. Joshua 1-12: A
New Translation with Introduction and Commentary (The Anchor Yale Bible Commentaries) giving you
information deeper and different ways, you can find any publication out there but there is no book that
similar with Joshua 1-12: A New Translation with Introduction and Commentary (The Anchor Yale Bible
Commentaries). It gives you thrill studying journey, its open up your eyes about the thing in which happened
in the world which is might be can be happened around you. It is easy to bring everywhere like in
playground, café, or even in your method home by train. If you are having difficulties in bringing the
imprinted book maybe the form of Joshua 1-12: A New Translation with Introduction and Commentary (The
Anchor Yale Bible Commentaries) in e-book can be your alternate.

Mary Hopkins:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information these days can get by anyone in everywhere.
The information can be a information or any news even an issue. What people must be consider when those
information which is inside former life are challenging to be find than now is taking seriously which one
works to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you find the unstable resource then you
buy it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All of those possibilities will not
happen within you if you take Joshua 1-12: A New Translation with Introduction and Commentary (The
Anchor Yale Bible Commentaries) as the daily resource information.

Evelyn Nay:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind skill or
thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book as compared to can
satisfy your short period of time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find guide that need
more time to be go through. Joshua 1-12: A New Translation with Introduction and Commentary (The
Anchor Yale Bible Commentaries) can be your answer as it can be read by a person who have those short
free time problems.

Carl Guerra:

As a student exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library or even make
summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's soul or real their
pastime. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to the library. They go to right now there but nothing
reading critically. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring along with can't see colorful
pictures on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As we know that



on this period, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore , this Joshua 1-12: A New Translation with Introduction and Commentary (The
Anchor Yale Bible Commentaries) can make you feel more interested to read.
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