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What Makes A President Great?

Academics, journalists, and popular historians agree. Our greatest presidents are the ones who confronted a
national crisis and mobilized the entire nation to face it. That’s the conventional wisdom. The chief
executives who are celebrated in textbooks and placed in the top echelon of presidents in surveys of experts
are the “bold” leaders— the Woodrow Wilsons and Franklin Roosevelts— who reshaped the United States in
line with their grand “vision” for America.

Unfortunately, along the way, these “great” presidents inevitably expanded government— and shrunk our
liberties.

As the twentieth-century presidency has grown far beyond the bounds the Founders established for the
office, the idea that our chief executive is responsible to “preserve, protect, and defend the Constitution of
the United States” has become a distant memory.

Historian and celebrated Reagan biographer Steven F. Hayward reminds us that the Founders had an entirely
different idea of greatness in the presidential office. The personal ambitions, populist appeals, and bribes
paid to the voters with their own money that most modern presidents engage in would strike them as
instances of the demagoguery they most feared— one of the great dangers to the people’s liberty that they
wrote the Constitution explicitly to guard against. The Founders, in contrast to today’s historians, expected
great presidents to be champions of the limited government established by the Constitution.

Working from that almost forgotten standard of presidential greatness, Steven Hayward offers a fascinating
off–the–beaten–track tour through the modern presidency, from the Progressive Era’s Woodrow Wilson to
Barack Obama. Along the way, he serves up fresh historical insights, recalls forgotten anecdotes, celebrates
undervalued presidents who took important stands in defense of the Constitution— and points the way to a
revival of truly constitutional government in America.

What you didn’t learn from your history teacher, but will find in The Politically Incorrect Guide™ to the
Presidents:
Progressive hero Woodrow Wilson aired a pro–Ku Klux Klan movie at the White House
Calvin Coolidge, much mocked by liberal historians as a bland Babbitt, was the last president to write his
own speeches, guided the country through years of prosperity and limited government, and was one of the
most cultured men ever to live in the White House
Why Eisenhower’s two biggest mistakes as president were, in his own words “both sitting on the Supreme
Court”
How as president JFK took mind–altering drugs, many of them prescribed by a physician he called “Dr.
Feelgood,” who later lost his medical license for malpractice
Nixon’s hysterically vilified Christmas bombing of North Vietnam in 1972 caused very few civilian
casualties and compelled North Vietnam to negotiate an end to the Vietnam War



The misunderestimated George W. Bush read 186 books during his presidency, mostly non–fiction,
biography, and history
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From reader reviews:

Alice Bowers:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information currently can get by anyone in everywhere.
The information can be a know-how or any news even an issue. What people must be consider if those
information which is inside the former life are challenging be find than now could be taking seriously which
one is acceptable to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you find the unstable resource
then you get it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will
not happen with you if you take The Politically Incorrect Guide to the Presidents: From Wilson to Obama
(The Politically Incorrect Guides) as your daily resource information.

Barbara Gunter:

The guide with title The Politically Incorrect Guide to the Presidents: From Wilson to Obama (The
Politically Incorrect Guides) includes a lot of information that you can discover it. You can get a lot of
benefit after read this book. This specific book exist new information the information that exist in this book
represented the condition of the world at this point. That is important to yo7u to know how the improvement
of the world. This particular book will bring you throughout new era of the glowbal growth. You can read
the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you want.

Alexandra Dickey:

Reading a book to get new life style in this yr; every people loves to go through a book. When you read a
book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge,
mainly because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what forms
of book that you have read. If you would like get information about your examine, you can read education
books, but if you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, as
well as soon. The The Politically Incorrect Guide to the Presidents: From Wilson to Obama (The Politically
Incorrect Guides) will give you a new experience in reading through a book.

Rosemary Robinson:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information simpler
to share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and soon. You
can see that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The book that recommended for you is
The Politically Incorrect Guide to the Presidents: From Wilson to Obama (The Politically Incorrect Guides)
this publication consist a lot of the information in the condition of this world now. That book was
represented so why is the world has grown up. The vocabulary styles that writer use to explain it is easy to
understand. Typically the writer made some analysis when he makes this book. This is why this book
appropriate all of you.
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