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Departing from the political economy perspective taken by the vast majority of volumes devoted to
Mesoamerican obsidian, Obsidian Reflections is an examination of obsidian's sociocultural
dimensions—particularly in regard to Mesoamerican world view, religion, and belief systems.

Exploring the materiality of this volcanic glass rather than only its functionality, this book considers the
interplay among people, obsidian, and meaning and how these relationships shaped patterns of procurement,
exchange, and use. An international group of scholars hailing from Belize, France, Japan, Mexico, and the
United States provides a variety of case studies from Mexico, Guatemala, Belize, and Honduras. The authors
draw on archaeological, iconographic, ethnographic, and ethnohistoric data to examine obsidian as a
touchstone for cultural meaning, including references to sacrificial precepts, powerful deities, landscape,
warfare, social relations, and fertility.

Obsidian Reflections underscores the necessity of understanding obsidian from within its cultural
context—the perspective of the indigenous people of Mesoamerica. It will be of great interest to
Mesoamericanists as well as students and scholars of lithic studies and material culture.
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From reader reviews:

Nancy Rush:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold on
guys this specific aren't like that. This Obsidian Reflections: Symbolic Dimensions of Obsidian in
Mesoamerica book is readable by simply you who hate those straight word style. You will find the facts here
are arrange for enjoyable reading through experience without leaving even decrease the knowledge that want
to offer to you. The writer regarding Obsidian Reflections: Symbolic Dimensions of Obsidian in
Mesoamerica content conveys objective easily to understand by a lot of people. The printed and e-book are
not different in the content material but it just different such as it. So , do you nevertheless thinking Obsidian
Reflections: Symbolic Dimensions of Obsidian in Mesoamerica is not loveable to be your top list reading
book?

Toby Lowry:

Reading a book to get new life style in this season; every people loves to read a book. When you study a
book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge, mainly
because book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what types of
book that you have read. If you would like get information about your review, you can read education books,
but if you act like you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics,
and also soon. The Obsidian Reflections: Symbolic Dimensions of Obsidian in Mesoamerica provide you
with a new experience in studying a book.

Michael Patterson:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make anyone
to understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information better to share.
You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and soon.
You will see that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended to your account is Obsidian Reflections: Symbolic Dimensions of Obsidian in Mesoamerica
this publication consist a lot of the information of the condition of this world now. This specific book was
represented how does the world has grown up. The dialect styles that writer value to explain it is easy to
understand. Often the writer made some analysis when he makes this book. Honestly, that is why this book
appropriate all of you.

Jose Garcia:

Beside this particular Obsidian Reflections: Symbolic Dimensions of Obsidian in Mesoamerica in your
phone, it can give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or info. The information and the
knowledge you will got here is fresh in the oven so don't become worry if you feel like an previous people
live in narrow commune. It is good thing to have Obsidian Reflections: Symbolic Dimensions of Obsidian in



Mesoamerica because this book offers to you readable information. Do you at times have book but you
seldom get what it's facts concerning. Oh come on, that would not happen if you have this in the hand. The
Enjoyable set up here cannot be questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss
the idea? Find this book in addition to read it from today!
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