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When the students in Nikki and Deja’s class find out that their school is going to hold its first-ever election
for student body president, some kids are more excited than others. But none is as excited as Deja, who
figures she’s a shoo-in for the third grade nomination. Deja decides that Nikki will be her campaign
manager, of course, and puts her to work right away. But will Deja’s tendency to rush into things and boss
people around alienate her best friend when she needs her most, and spoil her chances of becoming president
of Carver Elementary?

This is a charming new entry in a chapter book series praised for its humor and authentic characters.
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From reader reviews:

Lawrence Rowe:

The book Nikki and Deja: Election Madness (Nikki & Deja) gives you the sense of being enjoy for your
spare time. You need to use to make your capable much more increase. Book can to be your best friend when
you getting anxiety or having big problem using your subject. If you can make examining a book Nikki and
Deja: Election Madness (Nikki & Deja) to get your habit, you can get a lot more advantages, like add your
own personal capable, increase your knowledge about some or all subjects. You may know everything if you
like wide open and read a guide Nikki and Deja: Election Madness (Nikki & Deja). Kinds of book are a lot
of. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think about this guide?

Ellen Weiss:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information presently can get by anyone at everywhere.
The information can be a expertise or any news even restricted. What people must be consider while those
information which is inside former life are challenging to be find than now's taking seriously which one is
suitable to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you receive the unstable resource
then you obtain it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All of those possibilities
will not happen inside you if you take Nikki and Deja: Election Madness (Nikki & Deja) as your daily
resource information.

Joyce Matchett:

Nikki and Deja: Election Madness (Nikki & Deja) can be one of your beginning books that are good idea.
We recommend that straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary that will increase your
knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information. The author giving
his/her effort to put every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing Nikki and Deja: Election Madness
(Nikki & Deja) but doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader the hottest and also based confirm
resource information that maybe you can be one among it. This great information can easily drawn you into
fresh stage of crucial thinking.

Cheree Kramer:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Try
to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't determine book by its protect may doesn't work is
difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in the outside search
likes. Maybe you answer is usually Nikki and Deja: Election Madness (Nikki & Deja) why because the
fantastic cover that make you consider with regards to the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or
content is definitely fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly show you
to pick up this book.
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