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The practice of curanderismo, or Mexican American folk medicine, is part of a historically and culturally
important health care system deeply rooted in native Mexican healing techniques. This is the first book to
describe the practice from an insider's point of view, based on the authors' three-year apprenticeships with
curanderos (healers).

Robert T. Trotter and Juan Antonio Chavira present an intimate view of not only how curanderismo is
practiced but also how it is learned and passed on as a healing tradition. By providing a better understanding
of why curanderos continue to be in demand despite the lifesaving capabilities of modern medicine, this text
will serve as an indispensable resource to health professionals who work within Mexican American
communities, to students of transcultural medicine, and to urban ethnologists and medical anthropologists.
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From reader reviews:

Harold Froelich:

With other case, little people like to read book Curanderismo: Mexican American Folk Healing (de Vries
Lectures in Economics). You can choose the best book if you want reading a book. Given that we know
about how is important any book Curanderismo: Mexican American Folk Healing (de Vries Lectures in
Economics). You can add knowledge and of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right,
mainly because from book you can recognize everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you will
end up known. About simple issue until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we can easily open
a book or searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You need to use it when you feel bored stiff to go to
the library. Let's examine.

Young Legg:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with close friends is thing
that usually you may have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try factor that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you have been ride on and with addition details. Even you love Curanderismo: Mexican
American Folk Healing (de Vries Lectures in Economics), you are able to enjoy both. It is good combination
right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout fellas. What? Still
don't have it, oh come on its called reading friends.

Betty Williams:

Many people spending their time by playing outside with friends, fun activity having family or just watching
TV the entire day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by reading a book. Ugh, do you
consider reading a book can really hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It okay you can
have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Curanderismo: Mexican
American Folk Healing (de Vries Lectures in Economics) which is obtaining the e-book version. So , why
not try out this book? Let's observe.

Tyrone Hogans:

Is it a person who having spare time and then spend it whole day simply by watching television programs or
just lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Curanderismo: Mexican American Folk
Healing (de Vries Lectures in Economics) can be the answer, oh how comes? A book you know. You are so
out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So
what these guides have than the others?
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