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Becoming Bold & Beautiful
25 Years of Making the World's Most Popular Daytime Soap Opera

The Bold and the Beautiful is the world's most watched daily dramatic serial, seen by a daily viewing
audience of over 35 million people in more than 100 countries worldwide. Take a rare and revealing look at
what happens outside the camera frame as the cast and crew work to create episodes of the series, in studio in
Los Angeles; stage 31 of CBS Television City, its home for 25 years; and in such beautiful locations as
Paradise Cove in Malibu, California; Cabo San Lucas, Mexico' and Aspen, Colorado.

See how Stage 31 is transformed from an empty dark stage into a stunning family Christmas dinner at the
Forrester's sumptuous residence in Beverly Hills. Or how the crew shot on the hottest day of the year in
downtown Los Angeles on Skid Row. From special fall holidays, such as Thanksgiving and Halloween, to
episodes that shock the senses, such as Hope's graduation party, a modern-day take on a masquerade ball.
See images of CGI used to create Brooke and Thomas's berry-induced hallucination on the desert island in
the South Pacific.

Travel back in time to the inception of the series in 1987 and the early years, including the original press kit
and early black and white photos. See how the series creators, the Bell family, mirror the fictional Forrester
family. With a special section celebrating Darlene Conley (as knock-off queen "Sally Spectra") and never-
before-published photos of how it all began, fans of the series will live through the early days of the series
again.

For 25 years, The Bold and the Beautiful has delighted and fascinated audiences all over the world. Now the
spirit of the series, past and present, has been captured in more than 200 photographs of the cast and crew by
some of Hollywood's best photographers and complied into one work.
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From reader reviews:

Florence Croy:

What do you think about book? It is just for students as they are still students or it for all people in the world,
what the best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that problem above. Every person has different
personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that they don't want do
that. You must know how great as well as important the book Becoming Bold & Beautiful: 25 Years of
Making the World's Most Popular Daytime Soap Opera. All type of book is it possible to see on many
solutions. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Sandra Hughes:

The experience that you get from Becoming Bold & Beautiful: 25 Years of Making the World's Most
Popular Daytime Soap Opera is a more deep you excavating the information that hide in the words the more
you get interested in reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to understand but Becoming Bold &
Beautiful: 25 Years of Making the World's Most Popular Daytime Soap Opera giving you thrill feeling of
reading. The copy writer conveys their point in a number of way that can be understood by means of anyone
who read it because the author of this reserve is well-known enough. This kind of book also makes your
vocabulary increase well. It is therefore easy to understand then can go along with you, both in printed or e-
book style are available. We advise you for having this specific Becoming Bold & Beautiful: 25 Years of
Making the World's Most Popular Daytime Soap Opera instantly.

Richard Cassidy:

This Becoming Bold & Beautiful: 25 Years of Making the World's Most Popular Daytime Soap Opera are
generally reliable for you who want to be considered a successful person, why. The reason why of this
Becoming Bold & Beautiful: 25 Years of Making the World's Most Popular Daytime Soap Opera can be one
of the great books you must have is actually giving you more than just simple examining food but feed
anyone with information that maybe will shock your prior knowledge. This book is actually handy, you can
bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions throughout the e-book and printed people. Beside that this
Becoming Bold & Beautiful: 25 Years of Making the World's Most Popular Daytime Soap Opera forcing
you to have an enormous of experience for instance rich vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking that
we realize it useful in your day activity. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Myrtle Hamer:

Reading a book for being new life style in this yr; every people loves to read a book. When you study a book
you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, due to the
fact book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book
that you have read. If you want to get information about your study, you can read education books, but if you
act like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, these us novel, comics, in addition to soon. The



Becoming Bold & Beautiful: 25 Years of Making the World's Most Popular Daytime Soap Opera provide
you with a new experience in studying a book.
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